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MUFG DISCLAIMERS

MUFG Securities Asia Limited 

MUFG Securities Asia Limited (MUS(Asia)) (11/F, AIA Central, 1 Connaught Road Central, Hong Kong) is regulated by the Securities and Futures Commission of Hong 
Kong (CE No AAA889). This message is intended for the recipient only and cannot be further distributed, and should not be construed as a personal recommendation or 
an offer or solicitation to buy or sell any instrument. Products and services may be provided by an affiliate of MUS(Asia) as specified in documentation. Information may 
not be accurate or complete and are subject to change. Comments may not reflect the view of MUS(Asia) or affiliates. MUS(Asia) and affiliates disclaim all liability 
whatsoever arising from use of the message. 

MUFG Securities Asia Limited, Australia 

MUFG Securities Asia Limited (MUS(Asia)) ARBN 169329453 incorporated in HKSAR, is regulated by the HK SFC (AAA889) under HK law differing from Australia law; 
AFS license exempt for financial services to wholesale clients. This message is for the intended recipient only, not to be shared. This is not a recommendation, offeror 
solicitation to buy or sell. Products and services may be provided by our affiliates as specified. Information may not be accurate or complete and subject to change. 
Comments may not reflect the view of MUS(Asia) or affiliates and all liability whatsoever arising from this message is disclaimed. 

MUFG Securities Asia Ltd Singapore Branch 

MUFG Securities Asia Ltd Singapore Branch (MUS(Asia) SG) (7 Straits View, #23-01 Marina One E Tower, SG 018936) is incorporated in HK regulated by HK SFC and 
has a CMSL under the SG SFA. This message is intended for the recipient only and not to be further distributed or construed as personal recommendation or an offer or 
solicitation to buy or sell any instrument. Products and services may be provided by an affiliate of MUS(Asia) SG as specified in documentation. Information may not be 
accurate or complete and are subject to change. Comments may not reflect the view of MUS(Asia) SG or affiliates. MUS(Asia) SG and affiliates disclaims all liability 
whatsoever arising from use of the message. The following will apply only if you are in Singapore and communicating with a staff of MUS(Asia) in Hong Kong: such staff 
is acting for MUS(Asia) in Hong Kong, a “foreign office” of MUS(Asia) Singapore under Securities and Futures (Exemption for Cross-Border Arrangements) (Foreign 
Offices) Regulations 2021 and Financial Advisers (Exemption for Cross-Border Arrangements) (Foreign Offices) Regulations 2021, and such staff is not subject to MAS 
regulations. You will not be able to bring any claim for a breach of statutory duty under MAS regulations with respect to that staff, but it does not affect any civil rights or 
remedies that you may have under contract and/or general law.

MUFG Bank, Ltd. Sydney Branch and Melbourne Branch

IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information contained in this transmission is intended for the named recipient(s) only. It may contain privileged and/or confidential 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you must NOT copy nor in any way distribute nor take any action based upon it. If this transmission has been sent in 
error, please notify the sender and destroy the original. Thank you for your co-operation. E-mail transmissions may be interfered with or may contain computer viruses or 
other defects and may not be successfully replicated on other systems. We give no warranties in relation to these matters and accept no liability for any loss or damage 
that may be suffered as a result of the use of this transmission. Privacy is important to us. The purposes for which we collect, use and disclose personal information and 
the rights regarding access, correction and complaints relating to personal information can be found in our Privacy Policy which is available upon request. MUFG Bank, 
Ltd. ABN 75 103 418 882, AFS Licence No. 234561. Financial Service Providers (FSP) No. 14181 is a member of the MUFG group. 
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MUFG Bank, Ltd. Hong Kong Branch 

Important: This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential, and are intended for the named recipient(s) only. It may contain information that is legally 
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any use, disclosure, printing, dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any file 
transmitted with it is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please delete it and any copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by 
reply email, telephone or facsimile. Internet communications cannot be treated as official document, and cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error or virus-free. 
The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in transmission of the email and its contents. MUFG Bank, Ltd.(Incorporated in Japan with limited liability) 

MUFG Bank, Ltd. Singapore Branch 

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: The information contained in this communication is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and 
others authorised to receive it. If you, the reader, are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in 
relation to the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this message in error, please notify us by return e-mail and 
delete the original message. Neither the sender nor MUFG Bank, Ltd. shall be liable for the correct and complete transmission of the contents of an e-mail, or timely 
receipt by the intended recipient. Please note that your communication with us may be recorded and monitored for surveillance purposes. Thank you. 
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